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This book is a pioneering investigation of the tourism practices in the world's other, cold water, islands.
Located in extreme latitudes and subject to extreme weather conditions, these islands have been developing
their tourism appeal in manners that appear sustainable. They present themselves in images that speak to the
pristine, unique and superlative aspects of their natural environment, history and culture. Limited seasonality,
difficulty of access, restricted infrastructure, harsh climates and water too cold to swim in, are integral
features of the tourism industry, often welcomed as appropriate filters to the slide to the mass market.

The collection contains 13 island case studies. A set of seven hail from Northern latitudes: Baffin (Nunavut,
Canada), Banks (Northwest Territories, Canada), Greenland/ Kaalaalit Nunaat, Iceland, Luleå (Sweden),
Nunivak (Alaska), Solovetsky (Russia) and Svalbard (Norway). A second set of four cover the Southerly
islands of Chatham (New Zealand), Falklands, Macquarie (Australia) and Stewart (New Zealand). Two other
chapters discuss islands from the particular vantage points of cruise ship tourism, one for the Arctic region
and one for the Antarctic. Additionally, five conceptual chapters provide insights into key tourism
management issues, as they apply to cold water island experiences:(a) human resources; (b) environment; (c)
promotion; (d) seasonality; and (e) access.
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From reader reviews:

Micah Stahlman:

The book Extreme Tourism: Lessons from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research)
can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the great
thing like a book Extreme Tourism: Lessons from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism
Research)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many
details for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you
take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Extreme Tourism: Lessons
from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research) has simple shape however you know:
it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a guide.
So it is very wonderful.

Charlotte Ramsey:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept Extreme
Tourism: Lessons from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research) suitable to you?
Often the book was written by renowned writer in this era. The particular book untitled Extreme Tourism:
Lessons from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research)is the one of several books
that will everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read
this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, so all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give you
a lots of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world with this book.

George Sanders:

You may spend your free time to read this book this book. This Extreme Tourism: Lessons from the World's
Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research) is simple bringing you can read it in the park your car,
in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got much space to bring typically the printed book,
you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the book in your smart
phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Jesus Allgood:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Extreme Tourism:
Lessons from the World's Cold Water Islands (Advances in Tourism Research) which is having the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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