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Even the most perfect lives can be shattered in an instant. In this moving, emotionally charged novel,
Danielle Steel introduces readers to an unforgettable cast of characters striving to overcome tragedy and
discover the inner resources and resilience to win at life—once again.
 
WINNERS
 
Lily Thomas is an aspiring ski champion training for the Olympics, a young woman with her heart set on
winning the gold. But in one moment, Lily’s future is changed forever, her hopes for the Olympics swept
away in a tragic accident.
 
Dr. Jessie Matthews, the neurosurgeon who operates on her that night, endures a tragedy of her own, and
instantly becomes the sole support of her four young children, while her own future hangs in the balance.
 
Bill, Lily’s father, has pinned all his hopes on his only daughter, his dreams now shattered.
 
Other lives will entwine themselves with theirs: Joe, a financial manager, faces a ruined career at the hand of
a dishonest partner. Carole, a psychologist at Mass General, is a breast cancer survivor, her body and heart
scarred by what she’s been through. Teddy, with a spinal cord injury worse than Lily’s, dreams of college
and becoming an artist.
 
From the ashes of their lives, six people fight to alter the course of destiny and refuse to be defeated. When
Bill builds a remarkable rehab facility for his daughter, countless lives are forever altered, and each becomes
a winner.
 
Winners is about refusing to be beaten, no matter how insurmountable the challenge. And when Lily gets on
skis again and enters the Paralympics, the battle to brave life again is won.
 
Winners is about more than surviving, it is about courage, victory, and triumph. When all appears to be lost,
the battle has just begun.

Praise for Winners
 
“Steel skillfully weaves the strands of the Matthews and Thomas families together in a layered story. . . .
Together, they discover friendship, loyalty, and new dreams.”—Publishers Weekly
 
“[Winners] will leave readers crying and cheering.”—Booklist

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Greta Harty:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their
particular spare time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book
entitled Winners: A Novel? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have
various other opinion?

Johanna Garrett:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific Winners: A Novel book as beginner
and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Jesus Sandiford:

Here thing why this Winners: A Novel are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is
good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Winners:
A Novel giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no
book that similar with Winners: A Novel. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes
about the thing that will happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is easy to
bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Winners: A Novel in e-book can be your substitute.

Jeffrey Haller:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby.
And you also know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need
to know that reading is very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase
you knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to
something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of
them is Winners: A Novel.
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